
 
 

 

SEC/48/2017-63                                       September 15, 2025 
 

The Manager  

Compliance Department  

BSE Limited 

Phiroze Jeejeebhoy Tower 

Dalal Street 

Mumbai – 400 001 

The Manager  

Compliance Department 

The National Stock Exchange of India Ltd. 

Exchange Plaza 

Bandra – Kurla Complex, Bandra (East) 

Mumbai – 400 051 

Scrip Code/Symbol: 540678/COCHINSHIP 

 

Dear Sir/ Madam, 

Subject: Disclosure under Regulation 30 of SEBI LODR Regulations – 

Appointments to Senior Management 

 

1. Pursuant to Regulation 30 of the Securities and Exchange Board of India (Listing 

Obligations and Disclosure Requirements) Regulations, 2015 (“SEBI LODR Regulations”), it is 

hereby informed that the attached list of officials upon their promotion have become Senior 

Management Personnel (General Manager - E7 Level) of Cochin Shipyard Limited. 

 

2. The above is for your information and record please. 

 

Thanking You, 

For Cochin Shipyard Limited 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



List of officials  

 

Sl 

No 
Name Designation Brief Profile 

1 Shri Sreekumar Raja C A General Manager 

(Technical) 

Shri Sreekumar Raja C A, aged 57, 
is an M.Tech (Power Electricity) 
graduate. He joined Cochin 
Shipyard Limited in 1996 and has 
experience in various departments 
viz. Utilities & Maintenance, Ship 
Repair Materials, Project Planning, 
Shipbuilding Materials etc. He has a 
total experience of approximately 33 
years in the relevant fields. 

2 Shri A Vettriselvan General Manager 

(Materials) 

Shri A Vettriselvan, aged 54, is a 
B.Tech (Mechanical) graduate with 
Master of Business Administration in 
Marketing and Materials etc. He 
joined Cochin Shipyard limited in 
2004 and has experience in various 
departments viz. Shipbuilding 
Materials, Steel, Stores and Marine 
Engineering Training Institute etc. 
He has a total experience of 
approximately 29 years in the 
relevant fields. 

3 Shri Nagesh Krishna 

Moorthy 

General Manager 

(OSD-BD SB) 

Shri Nagesh Krishna Moorthy, aged 
53, is an M.Tech (Mechanical) 
graduate. He joined Cochin 
Shipyard limited in 2015 and has 
experience in various departments 
viz. Business Development, Ship 
Building, IQC and Materials & 
Logistics etc. He has a total 
experience of approximately 25 
years in the relevant fields. 

4 Shri Sanil Peter General Manager 

(Ship Repair) 

Shri Sanil Peter, aged 48, is a 
B.Tech (Naval and Shipbuilding) 
graduate with a Diploma in Business 
Management. He joined Cochin 
Shipyard limited in 2017 and has 
experience in various departments 
viz. Ship Design, Ship Repairs, Ship 
Construction, Contract Management 
and yard development projects. He 
has a total experience of 
approximately 25 years in the 
relevant fields. 

 



5 Shri Jathesh Chandra 

Gopinathan 

General Manager 

(Basic Design) 

Shri Jathesh Chandra Gopinathan, 
aged 52, is a B.Tech (Naval and 
Shipbuilding) graduate. He joined 
Cochin Shipyard limited in 2016 and 
has experience in various 
departments viz. Design, Defense 
Project Management and IAC etc. 
He has a total experience of 
approximately 29 years in the 
relevant fields. 

6 Shri Suresh Babu V General Manager 

(Defence Projects I) 

Shri Suresh Babu V, aged 58, is a 
B.E (Electrical) graduate. He joined 
Cochin Shipyard limited in 2015 and 
has experience in various 
departments viz. Electrical, Outfit 
IAC and Defense Projects etc. He 
has a total experience of 
approximately 34 years in the 
relevant fields. 

7 Shri Anoop Das General Manager 

(QC & T) 

Shri Anoop Das, aged 52, is an 
M.Tech (Mechanical) graduate. He 
joined Cochin Shipyard limited in 
2015 and has experience in various 
departments viz. Quality Control and 
Testing, Indigenous Aircraft Carriers 
(IAC) projects etc. He has a total 
experience of approximately 26 
years in the relevant fields. 

8 Shri Binoj Shankar General Manager 

(Design) 

Shri Binoj Shankar, aged 50, is a 
B.Tech (Electrical & Electronics) 
graduate. He joined Cochin 
Shipyard limited in 2003 as an 
Executive Trainee and has over 22 
years of experience in CSL in the 
field of Accommodation Outfit, 
Electrical Design (Commercial 
Vessels), Project Management and 
Marketing etc. 
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